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Item 8.01 Other Events.

As of July 23, 2019, Fiserv, Inc. (“Fiserv”) and First Data Corporation (“First Data”) received the final required regulatory approvals and non-objections
needed to complete the proposed acquisition of First Data by Fiserv contemplated by that certain Agreement and Plan of Merger, dated January 16, 2019
(the “Merger Agreement”), by and among Fiserv, 300 Holdings, Inc., a wholly owned subsidiary of Fiserv, and First Data. Subject to the satisfaction or
waiver of the remaining customary contractual conditions set forth in the Merger Agreement, the parties expect to close the proposed acquisition on or
about July 29, 2019.

Forward-Looking Statements

The information disclosed in this communication contains forward-looking statements within the meaning of the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act
of 1995, including statements regarding the ability of Fiserv to complete the proposed acquisition and related transactions and to achieve the synergies
described herein. Statements can generally be identified as forward-looking because they include words such as “believes,” “anticipates,” “expects,”
“could,” “should” or words of similar meaning. Statements that describe Fiserv’s future plans, objectives or goals are also forward-looking statements.

Forward-looking statements are subject to assumptions, risks and uncertainties that may cause actual results to differ materially from those contemplated
by such forward-looking statements. The factors that could cause Fiserv’s actual results to differ materially include, among others: the possibility that the
parties may be unable to achieve expected synergies and operating efficiencies in the transaction within the expected time frames or at all and to
successfully integrate the operations of First Data into those of Fiserv; such integration may be more difficult, time-consuming or costly than expected;
revenues following the transaction may be lower than expected, including for possible reasons such as unexpected costs, charges or expenses resulting
from the transaction; operating costs, customer loss and business disruption (including, without limitation, difficulties in maintaining relationships with
employees, customers, clients or suppliers) may be greater than expected following the transaction; the retention of certain key employees; the occurrence
of any event, change or other circumstances that could give rise to the termination of the merger agreement; the outcome of any legal proceedings that
have been or may be instituted against Fiserv, First Data and others related to the merger agreement; unforeseen risks relating to liabilities of Fiserv or
First Data may exist; conditions to the completion of the transaction may not be satisfied; the amount of the costs, fees, expenses and charges related to the
transaction, including the costs, fees, expenses and charges related to any financing arrangements entered into in connection with the transaction; the
parties’ ability to meet expectations regarding the timing, completion and accounting and tax treatments of the transaction. Fiserv and First Data are
subject to, among other matters, changes in customer demand for their products and services; pricing and other actions by competitors; general changes in
local, regional, national and international economic conditions and the impact they may have on Fiserv and First Data and their customers and Fiserv’s
and First Data’s assessment of that impact; rapid technological developments and changes, and the ability of Fiserv’s and First Data’s technology to keep
pace with a rapidly evolving marketplace; the impact of a security breach or operational failure on Fiserv’s and First Data’s business; the effect of
proposed and enacted legislative and regulatory actions in the United States and internationally affecting the financial services industry as a whole and/or
Fiserv and First Data and their subsidiaries individually or collectively; regulatory supervision and oversight, and Fiserv and First Data’s ability to comply
with government regulations; the impact of Fiserv’s and First Data’s strategic initiatives; Fiserv’s and First Data’s ability to continue to introduce
competitive new products and services on a timely, cost-effective basis; the ability to contain costs and expenses; the protection and validity of intellectual
property rights; the outcome of pending and future litigation and governmental proceedings; acts of war and terrorism; and other factors included in “Risk
Factors” in Fiserv’s and First Data’s respective filings with the Securities and Exchange Commission (the “SEC”), including their respective Annual
Reports on Form 10-K for the year ended December 31, 2018, in other documents that the companies file with the SEC, and under the captions
“Cautionary Statement Regarding Forward-Looking Statements” and “Risk Factors” in First Data’s and Fiserv’s joint proxy and consent solicitation
statement/prospectus that forms part of the registration statement on Form S-4 filed by Fiserv in connection with the transaction, all of which are available
at http://www.sec.gov. You should consider these factors carefully in evaluating forward-looking statements and are cautioned not to place undue reliance
on such statements. Fiserv assumes no obligation to update any forward-looking statements, which speak only as of the date of this communication.
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